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Executive summary 

Climate change is one of the most serious threats facing the planet and human development, 

and demands urgent global and national action. Scientific consensus is that a rising 
concentration of greenhouse gases, such as carbon dioxide, in the atmosphere owing to human 
activity is a key contributing factor to global climate change. In the UK, around 26% of the 
country’s carbon dioxide (CO2) emissions arise from energy use in homes (equivalent to 

142 MtCO2 or 38.7 MtC). Although many technologies and measures to secure substantial 
savings in energy use already exist and are commonly available, carbon emissions from the UK 
residential sector have not reduced substantially since 1990. 

Addressing carbon emissions for the existing housing stock will be crucial in enabling the UK to 
reduce its emissions to levels now required by law (at least 80% below 1990 levels by 2050). In 
March 2008, WWF published a report called How Low: Achieving optimal carbon savings from 
the UK’s existing housing stock. This explored the idea that a large-scale roll-out of energy 

efficiency measures which are cost-effective over their lifetime could lead to a 35% reduction in 
carbon emissions from existing housing by 2020. 

There is now increasing and broad-based political support to encourage such a large-scale roll-
out of retrofit measures. Several recent reports have demonstrated the urgent need for action in 
this field. Others have illustrated how a large-scale programme of retrofit measures may 
practically be implemented. Nonetheless, to achieve the scale of retrofit required will necessarily 

involve a massive level of upfront investment, notably in the purchase and installation of energy-
efficiency measures and low and zero-carbon (LZC) technologies. 

This report explores the opportunities for the economy presented by such a large-scale retrofit 
programme. This is important in the context of the recession, which has hit the construction 
industry particularly hard. It draws on the How Low report’s Scenario 1b (‘Economic potential’) 
as the basis for its figures. The report discusses the (gross) direct employment created through 

the installation of such measures, as well as the effect such a programme could have on 
indirect job creation (through the manufacturing supply chain and servicing). In addition this 
report explores the potential for household financial savings through reduced fuel bills, and the 
knock-on impact of the additional expenditure elsewhere in the economy. It finishes by 

examining the issues around the deliverability of a large-scale retrofit programme, including 
skills and employment levels, and expands on the policy recommendations proposed in the 
How Low report. 

SAVINGS FOR HOUSEHOLDS 

Installing energy-efficiency measures and LZC technologies will lead to lower fuel bills and save 
households money. These savings will have particular resonance for households in the current 
economic climate. The impact on the householder’s pocket will however depend on how the 
initial payment for the installation is financed. 

The balance of costs and lifetime savings of measures varies by country and depends critically 

on the assumptions made. However, the installation of a large package of energy-efficiency 
measures and LZC technologies could enable households to make substantial savings. Overall 
fuel savings for the UK population associated with a large-scale programme of retrofit are 
projected to be between £76bn (£70bn in England) and £131bn (£120bn in England) over the 
lifetime of the measures, depending on the set of assumptions used.  
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However, the ability to fulfil this potential within the UK will depend on investment in, and 
support of, domestic companies manufacturing energy-efficiency and LZC technologies. The 
rate of leakage (the proportion of job creation outside the UK associated with the intervention) 
did not form part of this research. 

DELIVERABILITY 

A significant opportunity exists for cost-effective energy-saving measures to be rolled out across 
the UK. The deliverability of a large-scale retrofit programme will be vastly improved if it is tied 
to key delivery points, including 1) point of sale, and 2) planned renovation work.  

The UK has already achieved a lot in tackling energy efficiency with programmes such as 

Decent Homes, Warm Front and CERT (and its predecessors). Over two-thirds of the available 
housing stock has already been upgraded with basic cavity wall and loft insulation and other 
‘quick win’ measures. Continued improvement in home energy efficiency will rely on a ‘whole-
home’ approach, with policies (including financial support) expanding to cover all home types 
and the full range of energy-efficiency measures available.  

From 2015 onwards, the ‘long wins’ will have to take precedence, including solid wall insulation 

and measures dealing with listed buildings. It can take many years to design and implement 
effective policy measures, and to affect change in the construction sector. To encourage 
widespread uptake of such measures by 2015, the policies to affect change need to be put in 
place now. 

Construction industry 

The recession has had a significant impact on the construction industry. The volume of 
construction output from first quarter 2008 to first quarter 2009 fell by 6% compared with the 
previous 12 month period. New housing work fell by 10%. And repair, maintenance and 

improvement (RMI) work fell by 9%. Estimates put job losses over the period of the recession as 
high as 450,000 – as much as 20% of the construction workforce.  

While output and employment in the construction sector are expected to pick up after the 
recession, the effects on the RMI sub-sector may persist. Therefore a large-scale programme of 
retrofit could provide an important boost to this sub-sector, which is characterised by a high 
number of small-to-medium enterprises (SMEs) and is particularly vulnerable to the impacts of 

the recession as disposable incomes fall and consumers cut back on non-essential work. If 
rapid enough, a package of policy incentives to support the roll-out of retrofit measures on a 
large scale could help many thousands of SMEs to remain solvent in these challenging 
economic times. 

The overall expansion of the construction sector immediately post-recession is predicted to 
create an annual recruitment requirement (ARR) of 37,000 jobs across the sector. A major 

retrofit programme would more than double this requirement. The implementation of an 
ambitious national retrofit programme will require a significant recruitment drive on top of current 
industry projections. 

A ‘whole-house’ approach to retrofit would be most effective. But if coordinated effectively this 
will require significant skills development and training, particularly in project-management (see 
below). Any retrofit programme must be designed for ready engagement from industry 

professionals, and therefore it must be cognisant of the key elements of ‘buildability’, set out in 
Chapter 5 of the report. 
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1 Introduction 

1.1 BACKGROUND TO THE STUDY 

Climate change is one of the most serious threats facing the planet and human development, 

and demands urgent global and national action. To prevent average global temperatures from 
increasing by more than 2°C above pre-industrial levels – a threshold above which severe and 
irreversible tipping points in the climate become increasingly likely – the world’s emissions of 
greenhouse gases must peak and start to fall steeply in the next 5 to 10 years, and drop by 50-
60% below 1990 levels by mid-century. Industrialised countries such as the UK need to be 
aiming to fully decarbonise their economies by 2050.  

The UK government acknowledges the challenge – and opportunity – that this represents: 

The transition to a low-carbon world will transform our whole economy. Lord Stern’s landmark 
Review in 2006 set out the economic case for action on climate change and for investment in a 

low-carbon economy4. Recognising that economic necessity, the UK has through the Climate 
Change Act become the first country in the world to adopt a legally binding target to reduce 
carbon emissions – by at least 26% by 2020 and by 80% by 2050. […] More efficient use of 
energy and other resources could save businesses and consumers in Britain billions of pounds 

every year. Much of this can be achieved from simple and cheap actions. The savings made 
could be quickly channelled into new investment. 

Low Carbon Industrial Strategy: A Vision, (BERR, DECC, March 2009). 

The latest available statistics5 show that around 26% of the UK’s CO2 emissions arise from 

energy use in homes – equivalent to around 142 MtCO2 or 38.7 MtC. The largest source of 
these emissions is space heating (53%) followed by hot water (19%) and electricity for 
appliances (16%).  

Although many technologies and measures to secure substantial savings in energy use already 
exist and are commonly available, carbon emissions from the UK residential sector have not 
reduced substantially since 1990 (Figure 1-1). Robust plans have been developed for 

decarbonising homes to be built in the future, yet the plans for reducing carbon emissions from 
the existing housing stock – expected to account for 80% of the country’s housing stock in 
20506 – are less clear. However, the government’s recent consultation on its Heat and Energy 
Strategy (HES, 2009) goes a long way further than has previously been stated by government 
in outlining a path for the future. 

                                                
4 The Stern Review (2006) proposed that an investment of 1% of global GDP per year is required in order to avoid the worst effects 
of climate change, and that failure to do so could risk global GDP being reduced by up to 20%.  
5 DECC (26 March 2009). 
6 Boardman (2007). 

9 

                                                
7 Defined as the installation of any measure that recoups its upfront costs by future savings on energy bills over its lifespan. 
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